
PURCHASING 

DEPARTMENT 
2150 Keith Bridge Road    Cumming, GA 30040          

Phone: 770-781-6603     Fax: 770-888-0222 

 
 

 

 

 

September 3, 2024 

 

 

Interstate All Battery 

190 Buford Hwy 

Suwanee, GA 30024 

Attn: Dan Chamblin 

 

Dear Mr. Chamblin: 

 

 

This is to advise you that your company has been awarded a renewal contract from BID# B21-

02, Electrical Parts & Supplies. The effective date of this contract is October 28, 2024 and 

terminates on October 27, 2025. 

 

This award is in accordance with the original terms and conditions of the contract and with your 

attached pricing to remain firm for the entire contract period. This award letter is not an official 

order. 

 

If you have any questions about this award, please contact Trey Tryan at 770-781-6603 or 

ttryan@forsyth.k12.ga.us. We appreciate your interest in the Forsyth County School System and 

your participation in our bidding process. 

 

 

 

 

Sincerely,   

 

 

 

 

Brad Richardson 

Director of Procurement Services 

 

 
 

 

 



FORSYTH COUNTY SCHOOL SYSTEM 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

 
 

 

 
 

 

B21-02 Electrical Parts & Supplies 
 

Interstate All Battery 

 

FCS Item 

Number 

 

Item Description 
(Including Make and Model if Applicable*) 

 

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity 

 

Unit of 

Issue 

 

Your Part 

Number 

 

Cost 

(Per Unit of 

Issue) 

 

Extended Cost 

BATTERY 
   

FCS Item 

Number 

Item Description 
(Including Make and Model if Applicable*) 

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity 

Unit of 

Issue 

Your Part 

Number 

Cost 

(Per Unit of 

Issue) 

 

Extended Cost 

E-BATT-0141 BATTERY-6 VOLT, 7AHP-POWER SONIC 

2 
 

Each SLA0925 $12.69 $25.38 

E-BATT-0168 BATTERY 12V 7AHR OR BATTERY 12V 8 AHR 

SAME SIZE-POWER SONIC-BATTERY FOR INTRUSION & FIRE ALARMS 230 
 

Each FAS1075 $15.69 $3,608.70 

E-BATT-0169 BATTERY 6V 4.5AHR-POWER SONIC 

1 
 

Each FAS0905 $7.69 $7.69 

E-BATT-0170 LANTERN BATTERIES- 

1 
 

Each DRY1403 $2.89 $2.89 

E-BATT-0171 RECHARGABLE BATTERY PACK FOR EXIT LIGHT- 

BCN800-2DWP 1 
 

Each NIC0061 $9.95 $9.95 

E-BATT-0172 BATTERY-FOR PLASTIC EXIT LIGHTS 

ELB121017 1 
 

Each ASC0085 $2.69 $2.69 

E-BATT-0174 1.2 VOLT 1100 MAH WITH PLUG BATTERY 

(MOSTLY GOES TO EXIT LIGHTS IN TRAILERS) 

BCN1100WP-GRAYBAR # BON1100WP-GRAINGER # 2XLD7 

 

1 
 

Each 

 

NIC1169 
 

$12.69 
 

$12.69 

E-BATT-0175 ENERGIZER LITHUM PHOTO BATTERIES-3.0 VOLT-(2 PER PACK) 

1 
 

Each PHO0015-2 $3.50 $3.50 

E-BATT-0176 BATTERY-6 VOLT 7 AHP-POWER SONIC 

20 
 

Each SLA0925 $12.69 $253.80 

E-BATT-0177 UPS AND FIRE ALARM-REPLACEMENT BATTERIES-APC 1500 

(TAKES 2 12 VOLT 18 AMP TO MAKE ONE) 40 
 

Each SLA1116 $39.69 $1,587.60 

E-BATT-0178 3.6 VOLT BATTERY 2100MAH LITHIUM-PART # LITHLS14500BA 

2 
 

Each LIT2061 $4.62 $9.24 

E-BATT-0180 BATTERY 6 VOLT 2.8 AH-INTERNET COMMUCATION 

9 
 

Each SLA0902 $9.50 $85.50 

E-BATT-0181 12V 4.5AH BATTERIES SLA .187 FASTON **INTERSTATE SEC1050** 

2 
 

Each FAS1055 $10.69 $21.38 

 



PURCHASING 
DEPARTMENT 
2150 Keith Bridge Road. Cumming, GA 30040  
Phone: 770-781-6603    Fax: 770-888-0222 

September 3, 2024 

Voss Lighting  
2129 Northwest Pkwy SE 
Suite 129 
Marietta, GA 30067 
Attn: Russell Hanak 

Dear Mr. Hanak: 

This is to advise you that your company has been awarded a renewal contract from BID# B21-
02, Electrical Parts & Supplies. The effective date of this contract is October 28, 2024 and 
terminates on October 27, 2025. 

This award is in accordance with the original terms and conditions of the contract and with your 
attached pricing to remain firm for the entire contract period. This award letter is not an official 
order. 

If you have any questions about this award, please contact Trey Tryan at 770-781-6603 or 
ttryan@forsyth.k12.ga.us. We appreciate your interest in the Forsyth County School System and 
your participation in our bidding process. 

Sincerely, 

Brad Richardson 
Director of Procurement Services 
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FCS Item 
Number

Item Description
(Including Make and Model if Applicable*)

Unit 
of 

Issue
Your Part Number

Cost                             
(Per Unit 
of Issue)

E-BALL-0019 BALLAST120/277V ADVANCE 72C7984 NP 70W HPS S62 BULB Each ADV72C7984NP001 $113.24
E-BALL-0035 BALLAST-ELECTRONIC , 277V,4-F32T8RS Each ADVICN4P32N $14.66
E-BALL-0044 BALLAST- HPS, MULTI, 120,208,240,277V, 1-100W-S-54 ADVANCE #71A8071-

001D QUADRI-VOLT BALLAST KIT Each ADV71A8071001D $61.67

E-BALL-0052 BALLAST, HPS, ADVANCE #72C8084-N-P FOR 1-100W-S54 BULB, HIGH 
PRESSURE Each ADV72C8084NP001 $108.45

E-BALL-0069
BALLAST- HPS, MULTI, 120,208,240,277V, 1-70W S-62, ADVANCE 71A7971-001D-
PART # 1A975 Each ADV71A7971001D $68.29

E-BALL-0080
BALLAST- HPS, MULTI, REPLACEMENT KIT FOR 150W S-55, HIGH PRESSURE 
SODIUM CORE & COIL, ADVANCE #71A8172-001D-# 1A032 Each ADV71A8172001D $70.02

E-BALL-0089
BALLAST- MET, HALIDE REPLACEMENT KIT FOR M-59-400W, MULTI, ADVANCE 
#71A6071-001D
Grainger# 1A029

Each ADV71A6071001D $72.48

E-BALL-0112
BALLAST REL-4P32-SC 120V 4 BULB ELECTRONIC T8 BULBS ADVANCE-
GRAINGER PART #1VN22(OLD # 3V553) Each ADVICN4P32N $14.66

E-BALL-0114 BALLAST VEL-2P59-S-RH-TP 277V 2 BULB F96T8 Each ADVIOP2P59N $23.71
E-BALL-0116

BALLAST REL3P32SC 120V 3 BULB T8 ELECTRONIC ADVANCE-OLD PART # 
3V551-NEW PART # 1VN21 Each ADVICN3P32N $13.18

E-BALL-0205
BALLAST- FLUORESCENT, ELECTRONIC 1 OR 2 TUBE, SINGLE, 277 VOLTS, 2- 
F32T8RS, ADVANCE VEL-2P32-SC- PART # 4PL80 NEW PART # 2MCX5 Each ADVICN2P32N $11.50

E-BALL-0206
BALLAST ADVANCE ICF-2S13-H1-LD
1 R2 13 WATT 4 PIN QUAD OR TRIPLE Each ADVICF2S13H1LDK $18.47

E-BALL-0208
BALLAST-1500 WATT-M48- MEATAL HALIDE-480 VOLT-60 HZ CWA-ADVANCE-
ADV100 ADVANCE # 71A6742-001-GRAINGER # 6CAT4 Each ADV71A6742001 $189.01

E-BALL-0260
BALLAST 277V ADVANCE 2 LAMP 110 WATT STANDARD VEL2S110-AND F48 HO Each ADVICN2S110SC $36.62

E-BALL-0272
BALLAST ADVANCE ICF2S26H1LDK 2 LAMP, 120/277 VOLT 26 WATT; LEADS OUT 
OF SIDE-PART # 4ZZ35 Each ADVICF2S26H1LDK $19.58

E-BALL-0276
BALLAST ADVANCE VEL-3P32-SC-277V FOR 3 F32T8 RS/15-OLD  PART # 3V552 
NEW PART # 1VN21 Each ADVICN3P32N $13.18

E-BALL-0280
BALLAST ADVANCE REL2P60S - 120V FOR 2 F96T12 SLIMLINE -NEW #4VMY6
UNIVOLT #ICN2P60SC Each ADVICN2P60N $24.64

E-BALL-0282
BALLAST AC ELECTRONICS TSD-755PS 277V FOR 1 OR 2 FT55-# TSD-
UV55PBXMS Each ADVICN2S5490CN $39.35

E-BALL-0283 BALLAST ADVANCE 175 W METAL HALIDE MULTI TAP-#3A531A Each ADV71A5570001D $54.57
E-BALL-0284 BALLAST ADVANCE 72C7884NP001 50W HPS Each ADV72C7884NP001 $234.54
E-BALL-0285 BALLAST ADVANCE 71A8080510D 100W HPS Each

E-BALL-0286
BALLAST-WORK HORSE-MODEL # WH5-120-L-THESE ARE FOR WEST & 
LAMBERT FREEZERS & COOLER Each FULWH5120L $27.43

E-BALL-0343
100W HID BALLAST METAL HALIDE
71A5390-001D Each ADV71A5390001D $70.23

E-BALL-0345 250W HID BALLAST METAL HALIDE-#3A532A Each ADV71A5770001D $69.09
E-BALL-0347 400W HPS MULTI TAP INCLUDING 480V-PART # 1FYE1 Each ADV71A8453001D $121.00
E-BALL-0351 HPS IGNITOR FOR 150W THROUGH 400W HPS BULBS-PART # 3A534 Each ADVLI501H4IC $41.67
E-BALL-0353 BALLAST 70W METAL HALIDE BALLAST KIT 71A5292-001D Grainger# 3LE31 Each ADV71A5292001D $77.16
E-BALL-0355 BALLAST- FLUORESCENT ADVANCE V-2S40-TP 277V(2) T12 Each ADVICN2S40N $16.19
E-BALL-0363 BALLAST- FLUORESCENT ADVANCE R-2S40-TP 120V (2) T12 BULBS Each ADVICN2S40N $16.19
E-BALL-0381 BALLAST HPS, MULTI 120, 208, 240, 277V 1-250W Each ADV71A8271001D $86.67
E-BALL-0387 BALLAST F96T12/HO REL2S110 Each ADVICN2S110SC $36.62
E-BALL-0390

ADVANCE 250 WATT METAL HALIDE ENCLOSED BALLAST 120/277 V
72C5782NP001 Each ADV72C5782NP001 $146.62

E-BALL-0513
BALLAST-100 WATT METAL HILIDE  FOR A RECESSED LIGHT
ADVANCE # 72C5381-NP Each ADV72C5381NP001 $104.71

B21-02 Electrical Parts & Supplies Voss Lighting

BALLAST

FORSYTH COUNTY SCHOOLS
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
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E-BALL-0514

BALLAST-1000 WATT HPS 480 VOLT
71A8743-001 ADVANCE
 GRAINGER PART#6V763
GOES TO E-BULB-0501

Each ADV71A8743001 $210.86

E-BALL-0515
BALLAST-ADVANCE-400 WATT-120/277 VOLT-HID-CAT # 72C6182-NP-METAL 
HALIDE-PULSE START Each ADV72C6182NP $539.40

E-BALL-0516
ADVANCE BALLEST-480 VOLT 100 WATT METAL HALIDE-#71A5340-T-(C.E.S 
PART # 71A5340500DT) Each ADV71A5340500DT $312.55

E-BALL-0517 BALLAST-HID KIT CORE & COIL-1500W -277 VOLT-GRAINGER #1XWJ9 Each ADV71A6772001 $209.63
E-BALL-0518 WATTS STOPPER POWER PACK-120/230/277 WATTS BZ-50 Each WATBZ50 $24.42

E-BALL-0519
BALLAST FOR T5 LAMPS-ADVANCE
F54T5/HO
1CN2S54

Each ADVICN2S54T $17.57

E-BALL-0520
UNIVERSAL-ADVANCE SIGN BALLAST-ESB848-46-001
4,5 OR 6 T12HO 800M A LAMPS
120-277 VAC 50/60 HZ

Each ADVISB084846EI $88.84

E-BALL-0521 ADVANCE BALLAST KIT WITH BRACKET-ICF-2S42-M2LDK-120-277 42W Each ADVICF2S42M2LDK $23.06
E-BALL-0522

KEYSTONE BALLAST-#KTEB-218-UV-TP-PIC-DW 60HZ 120V/0.38A THRU 277V/ 
0.17A Each ADVICF2S18H1LDK $18.47

E-BALL-0524 LED DRIVER D15CC55UNVTZ-C INPUT 120 TO 277 VOLTS 50/60HZ Each No Bid No Bid
E-BALL-0525

PHILLIPS ADVANCE XITAINIUM LED DRIVER 120-277V 27-54VDC 
X1040C110V054BPT1 Each ADVXI040C110V054BPT

1M
$80.79

E-BALL-0526
GYMS, 2 X 2 LAY-IN HOWARD FIXTURES DRIVER MADE BY THOMAS RESEARCH Each No Bid No Bid

E-BALL-0528 SWITCH-HITTER AC-50CD1.4UV-TS LED DRIVER Each No Bid No Bid

FCS Item 
Number

Item Description
(Including Make and Model if Applicable*)

Unit 
of 

Issue
Your Part Number

Cost                       
(Per Unit 
of Issue)

E-BULB-0390 150/Q/DC/130 7613-PART # 2V703 ESAM#58270 Each VOSETC $5.18
E-BULB-0391 LED WHITE E12 120WATT-T20E12-120W  E SAM# LEDT20E12-120W Each No Bid No Bid
E-BULB-0392 MXR32/C/VBU/O-PART # 1E279 Each No Bid No Bid
E-BULB-0393 QF100 1000W FEL 1000 FEC-PART # 4V251 E SAM#54570 Each VOSFEL $18.22
E-BULB-0396 BULB 25W MEDIUM BASE T10CL25-PART # 4V461 ESAM# 18510 Each GNC25T10CL $1.82
E-BULB-0397 BULB T10CL40 MEDIUM BASE-PART # 4V879  E SAM#18652 Each PHLBC40T10 $1.21
E-BULB-0398 BULB GE #64 BAYONET (TWIST IN) BASE-PART # 6VC47 E SAM#64 Each MIN64 $0.37
E-BULB-0400 METAL HALIDE BULB 100W MEDIUM BASE-PART # 2F944 E SAM #46136

Each
PHLMHC100UMP3KELI

TE
$30.30

E-BULB-0402 MINI FLUORESCENT BULB 18W 2 PIN CF18DD/841 (CF18DD/E/835)-PART # 
1PGW9 E SAM 32018Q35K Each PHLPLC18W41ALTO $7.53

E-BULB-0403 METAL HALIDE 175 W MEDIUM BASE M175UMED E SAM#64479 Each PHLMH175UM $17.06
E-BULB-0404 MERCURY VAPOR 100W MOGUL BASE  LAMP HR100DX38-PART # 2V477 Each PHLH38JA100DX $13.93
E-BULB-0405 MECURY VAPOR 175W MOGUL BASE LAMP HR175/DX/39-PART # 5V686 E 

SAM #69445 Each PHLH39KC175DX $8.08
E-BULB-0406 MINI FLUORESCENT BULB 13W CF13DD/835/ECO (SYLVANIA) 

F13DBX23/841/ECO (GE) E SAM#21118 Each
PHLPLC13W35USAALT

O
$5.40

E-BULB-0408 F13DBX/841/ECO4P (GE)-*4 PIN*-PART # 1PGW5 DIMMABLE ESAM 
#CF13DD/E/835 Each PHLPLC13W414PALTO $5.20

E-BULB-0410 15T6 130V T6CL15-PART # 1E545 ESAM#18038 Each PHL15T6150V $1.29
E-BULB-0411 20T 6 1/2 CL (BULB T6.5CL20INT 130V)-PART # 4V479 E SAM#4316 Each PHL20T612IF $1.16
E-BULB-0413 500T3QCL 130V (BULB 500W T3Q/P/CL 125/130V QUARTZ HALOGEN) 

Q500T2,5/CL-PART # 2V384 ESAM#58996 Each PHL500T3QPCL120V $4.58
E-BULB-0414 50PAR20/CAP/SPL/NFL30 130V-50PAR 20H FL25 130-PART # 4V101 E SAM 

#16109 Each PHL39PAR20EVPFL $6.43
E-BULB-0418 60W 130V-PART # 5V598 E SAM #20812 Each PHL43A19EV $4.42
E-BULB-0419 BULB 6S6 130V (S6 6W)-12 BULBS IN ONE BOX- PART # 4V443 E SAM#16938 Each PHL6S6 $0.48
E-BULB-0421 800W QUARTZ HALOGEN DXX  ESAM# E DXX Each VOSDXX $10.98

BULB
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E-BULB-0424 CF18DD/E/835 OR F18/DBX/SPX841/840/4P (1E593)-PART # 1PGZ6
Each PHLPLC18W414PALTO $7.53

E-BULB-0425 MINI FLUORESCENT F26DBX/841/ECO (BULB 26W 2 PIN (GRAINGER #1PGY3) 
E SAM# 21115 Each PHLPLC26W41ALTO $7.53

E-BULB-0429 CF7DS/835 -- F7BX/841 OR F7BX/SPX35-PART # 1PGT5 ESAM#21274
Each PHLPLS7W8412PALTO $2.87

E-BULB-0430 CF9DD/835 -- F9BX/835 OR F9BX/SPX35-PART # 1PGT8 ESAM#21273 Each GEF9BX835ECO $1.61
E-BULB-0431 EHD500-500W -- EHD Q 500CL/TP-PART # 5V592 ESAM#54508 Each USHEHD $14.22
E-BULB-0432 EHG750 750W -- HHGQ750CL/TP-PART # 5V593 ESAM#54512 Each VOSEHG $15.49
E-BULB-0434 F17T8/SP41/ECO-PART # 6XT99 ESAM#FF17T8/741K Each PHLF17T8TL841ALTO $5.59
E-BULB-0435 F25T8/SPX41/ECO-PART # 6XV07 Each PHLF25T8TL841ALTO $4.74
E-BULB-0436 FO32/735 -- F32T8/SP41/ECO-PART # 4PL16 ESAM#F32T8/741K Each PHLF32T8TL941ALTO $2.37
E-BULB-0438 F096/735-T8 8 INCH SINGLE PIN BULB-PART # 2D049 ESAM#21737

Each
PHLF96T8TL835PLUSA

LTO
$11.15

E-BULB-0439 MINI FLUORESCENT F13BX/841/ECO ESAM#21137
Each

PHLPLS13W8412PALT
O

$2.87

E-BULB-0440 13W F13DBX/841/ECO ESAM#97588
Each

PHLPLC13W41USAALT
O

$5.40

E-BULB-0442 MINI FLUORESCENT F26DDX835/4P/EOL (BULB 26W 4 PIN) (CF26DD/E/841)-
PART # 1PGY7/E SAM # 20669 Each PHLPLC26W414PALTO $7.53

E-BULB-0443 F30T12/CW/RS 30W FL 2' -- F25T12/CW/RS/WM-PART # 4V610 ESAM#23476
Each PHLF30T12CWRSALTO $4.63

E-BULB-0446 F48T12/CW/HO 60W FL 4' FREEZER & COOLER-BULBS-BLACK FLAT TIP-PART 
# 3V443-
****DO NOT RE-ORDER T12****** ESAM#25146

Each PHLF48T12CWHOALTO $7.22

E-BULB-0447 150 PAR/FL/BLUE 130V-PART # 1E033 ESAM#19465 Each GE150PARFLB $32.65
E-BULB-0449 F64T12/CW/H0-PART # 4V937 ESAM#25352 Each GEF64T12CWHO $12.58
E-BULB-0450 F8T5/CW-THESE CAN ONLY BE ORDERED IN A CASE-BUT WE CHARGE OUT 

AS EACH-PART # 2V235 ESAM#21366 Each PHLF8T5CW $2.99
E-BULB-0451 F96T12/CW/HO/SS 95 WATT-PART # 3V351 ESAM#25134

Each
PHLF96T12CWHOOALT

O
$9.51

E-BULB-0452 F96T12/CW 60W-PART# 3V480 E SAM #29478
Each

PHLF96T12CWSUPREM
EALTO

$10.91

E-BULB-0453 F31T8/SPX41/U-PART # 2ETT9 E SAM 21878
Each PHLFB31T8TL841ALTO $12.64

E-BULB-0454 FBO32/841 FL U SHAPE OCTAGON F32T8/SPX41/U/6-GRAINGER PART # 3V977 
E SAM#F32T8/835K/U6 Each PHLFB32T8TL8416ALT $11.93

E-BULB-0456 FT18/DL/841 OR F18BX/841-PART # 6V033 ESAM#20589 Each PHLPLL18W41 $12.90
E-BULB-0457 FT55/DL/841 -- F55BX/841-PART # 67533 ESAM#20592 Each SYLFT55DL841 $10.45
E-BULB-0458 150 PAR/FL/GREEN 130V0-GRAINGER # 1E030 E SAM#19467 Each GE150PARFLG $38.25
E-BULB-0459 BULB GE #455 ESAM#455 Each MIN455 $0.76
E-BULB-0460 BULB GE #7613-PART # 6VK92 E SAM 7613 Each MIN7613 $8.18
E-BULB-0461 BULB GE #787-PART # 1C393 E SAM #787 Each MIN787 $6.54
E-BULB-0462 BULB GE #908 6V 1.50A-PART # 6YF20 ESAM#908 Each MIN908 $0.35
E-BULB-0463 BULB GE #909-6V 0.62A-PART # 1C304 E SAM #909 Each MIN909 $0.37
E-BULB-0464 GE 912-GRAINGER PART # 3BB25 ESAM#912 Each MIN912 $0.37
E-BULB-0465 BULB GE #915-PART # 1C300 E SAM#44771 Each MIN915 $0.38
E-BULB-0466 GE 927-PART # 1E538 E SAM # 927 Each MIN927 $0.51
E-BULB-0467 H33GL 400/DX -- HR 400 DX 33-PART  2V358 E SAM #69450 Each PHLH33GL400DX $14.76
E-BULB-0468 HPL 575 WATT  130V-PART # 1E942 NEW PN #3DXR4 Projector lamp E SAM # 

1000543 Each USHHPL575120V $17.83
E-BULB-0469 150 PAR/FL/RED 130V-PART 3 1E028 E SAM #19468 Each GE150PARFLR $38.25
E-BULB-0470 HPS LU100/MED (BULB 100W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 4V604 E SAM 

#67506 Each PHLC100S54M $11.42
E-BULB-0471 HPS LU100/MOG (BULB 100W HPS MOGUL BASE)-PART  2V519-NEW PART # 

2VAD5 E SAM#67514 Each PHLC100S54ALTO $14.62
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E-BULB-0472 HPS LU150/MOG (BULB 150W HPS MOGUL BASE) LU/150/55-PART # 2V452 E 
SAM #67516 Each PHLC150S55ALTO $11.36

E-BULB-0473 HPS LU150/MED (BULB 150W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 2V713/E SAM 
#67508 Each PHLC150S55M $11.36

E-BULB-0474 HPS LU250 (BULB 250W HPS MOGUL BASE BULB)-PART # 2V520NEW # 3APT5 
ESAM#67578 Each PHLC250S50ALTO $11.34

E-BULB-0475 HPS LU400 BULB 400W HPS MOGUL BASE-PART # 2V453-NEW PART # 3APT6/ 
E SAM #67533 Each PHLC400S51ALTO $11.34

E-BULB-0476 HPS LU50/MED (BULB 50W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 2V657 ESAM#67502 Each PHLC50S68M $14.54
E-BULB-0477 LU50/MOG-PART # 1C292 ESAM#67510 Each PHLC50S68ALTO $20.40
E-BULB-0478 HPS LU70/MED (BULB 70W HPS MEDIUM BASE)-PART # 2V632 ESAM#67504 Each PHLC70S62M $11.32
E-BULB-0479 HPS LU70/MOG (BULB 70W HPS MOGUL BASE) ESAM#67512 Each PHLC70S62ALTO $11.24
E-BULB-0480 150/Q/CL/DL 130V -- Q150CL/MC (ETG)-PART # 2V701 ESAM#Q150CL/MC/2V-

130V Each VOSETG $10.63
E-BULB-0481 METAL HALIDE M175/U (BULB 175W  MOGUL BASE) MVR175/U-PART # 4V550 

ESAM#MH175/U Each PHLMH175U $15.56
E-BULB-0482 METAL HALIDE M250/U (BULB 250W MOGUL BASE) MVR250/U-PART # 2V712 

ESAM#MH250/U Each PHLMH250U $14.32
E-BULB-0483 METAL HALIDE M400/U (BULB 400W MOGUL BASE) MVR400/U-SYLVANIA # 

6449-0 CLEAR ONLY ESAM#64036 Each PHLMH400UE $15.34
E-BULB-0487 METAL HALIDE MXR50/U/MED/O 50W MEDIUM BASE MXR50/U/MED/O-PART # 

6XT91 
ESAM #MP50/U/MED/3K

Each
PHLMHC50UMP3KELIT

E
$36.96

E-BULB-0488 METAL HALIDE MVR70/U/MED 70W MEDIUM BASE MVR70/U/MED-PART 3 
1E694 ESAM#MP70/U/MED/3K Each PHLMHC70UM4KELITE $29.00

E-BULB-0489 GE- BULB 26 WATT 1700 LUMENS- (USED FOR VENT HOOD)- E. SAM JONES #  
29026-1 Each PHLELMDT23W $5.22

E-BULB-0490 GE- ROUGH SERVICE COVERGUARD-60 WATT - A-19 UTILITY BULB-COATED-
2 BULBS PER PACK. PART # 5V763-NEW # 4HCL3 ESAM#10503 Each PHL60ATF $1.80

E-BULB-0491 BULB-60 WATT COATED MEDIUM BASE (HOT PASS THROUGH) ESAM#6147 Each PHL60ATF $1.80
E-BULB-0493 32 WATT BULB-4 PIN FLOURESCENT SCF32DT/E/IN/841-PART # 1PHA5 

ESAM#20886 Each
PHLPLT32W841A4PALT

O
$10.04

E-BULB-0496 T-12 U SHAPE OCTAGON F35CW/U/6/WM-PART # 3V528 ESAM#24004
Each

PHLFB40T12CWSUPRE
ME6ALTO

$10.75

E-BULB-0499 PLEXI GLASS 2X4 LAY IN LENS NOTE: WANT THICKER LENS-ORDER FROM  
E.SAM JONES-PART # PSP.125 Each No Bid $0.00

E-BULB-0501 BULB 1000 WATT ESAM#67307 Each PHLC1000S52ALTO $56.90
E-BULB-0504 PHILLIPS-T3-WORK AND SECURITY LAMP-HALO QUARTZS-300 WATT-120 

VOLTS-LOWE'S PART # 18833-GRAINGER # 2CVB6 ESAM#58998 Each PHLBC300T3QCLTP $3.50
E-BULB-0505 METAL HALIDE-HID LAMP- 1500  WATT-GENERAL ELECTRIC-GRAINGER # 

4V484 NOTE: THESE ARE STATIUM LAMPS--MUST STAY WITH G.E. 
GE#GMVR1500/U/SPORT  E SAM # 47326

Each GEMVR1500USPORTS $27.10

E-BULB-0506 LAMPS FOR A SALSD COOLER-HER/FO21/865/XP/ECO-HERITAGE LIGHT BULB 
6500K E SAM#21730 Each No Bid No Bid

E-BULB-0508 F54T5/841/HO/ECO/ICEA 4' T5 HIGH OUTPUT/E SAM #21043
Each PHLF54T5841HOALTO $5.86

E-BULB-0509 BTN 120 VOLT 750 WATT ESAM#54687 Each VOSBTN $19.72
E-BULB-0511 42 WATT LAMP-F42TBX/841/A-ECO-GRAINGER # 1PHA9-THESE BULS GO TO 

LAMBERT H.S. E SAM#20890 Each
PHLPLT42W841A4PALT

O
$11.43

E-BULB-0512 MP400/BU 400W METAL HALIDE WITH EXTENDED TIP BASE CLEAR ONLY 
SYLVANIA E SAM#64705 Each PHLMP400BU $35.46

E-BULB-0513 BTL-500 WATT -T6-BASE-P27S-120 VOLTS-CLEAR- E SAM #54685 Each VOSBTL $14.40
E-BULB-0514 HPL 575  115 VOLT Each USHHPL575115V $18.44
E-BULB-0516 SYLVANIA-LED MEDIUM BASE BULB=#78807-(LONG LASTING TO GO WHERE 

THE PAR 90'S GO) E SAM#19PAR38G3DlM/830FL40 Each
PHLLEDPAR38FL83014

WDG
$8.43

E-BULB-0517 F20T12CW-BULBS-20 WATT-GRAINGER # 6NB14 E SAM # 22078 Each PHLF20T12CWALTO $4.05
E-BULB-0518 COATED LAMP FOR SERVING LINE F15T8-CW-SY-PSG ADVANTECH SAFTY 

GUARDED-ITEM # 21616 E SAM # F15T8CW Each GNCF15T8CWTF $5.59
E-BULB-0520 HPL 750/115/X (UFC) 750 WATT 115 VOLT G9.5 W/HIS OSRAM NAED 54611 E 

SAM #54611 Each USHHPL750115X $18.20
E-BULB-0521 FLK 575 115V G9.5 E SAM #1000543 Each VOSFLK $21.15
E-BULB-0522 SYLVANIA LAMP-10038 120/CS S15A15 130V E SAM #10038 Each GNC15A15 $0.74
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E-BULB-0523 VULCAN LAMP AND HOLDER FOR A VULCAN OVEN-VH357036-1 40W 120V Each No Bid No Bid
E-BULB-0524 F21T5/830/ECO/TF TEFLON COATED LAMP Each PHLF21T5830ALTOTF $21.91
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